
Happenings 

JOIN THE FUTURE OF STRATEGY: The AI Community of Interest for Strategy 
Professionals Webinar Series will present an engaging and informative platform 
designed for enthusiasts, professionals, and organizations interested in the ever-
evolving world of artificial intelligence. In the first session on November 16th, we 
will embark on a journey through the history of AI, Big Data, and machine 
intelligence. Join us as we unravel the intricate workings of this groundbreaking 
technology. Sign up here! There is no charge to attend. (POC:  Doug Maris) 

NEXT GENERATION OF FORESIGHT LEADERS – YOUNG VOICES AWARDS: 
Teach the Future will recognize  27 Young Voices this year for their outstanding 
project proposals, passion for their sector, and use of futures thinking. NGFL 
received three times as many applications for its 2023 Young Voices Awards as in 
previous years, showing a growing interest in futures and foresight work around 
the world. Read more about the Young Voices Network and the 2023 winners.  

PROFESSIONAL FORESIGHT CERTIFICATION: TFSX offers Professional 
Certification in Natural Foresight® which is endorsed by the Global Foresight 
Advisory (GFAC). For those who meet eligibility for the first designation in the 
pathway, Certified Foresight Practitioner, the next online testing window is Dec 1 – 
Feb 15 (applications are due December 15). Learn more information about the 
credential here  or reach out to info@tfsx.com to discuss a customized learning 
journey. 
 
SURVEY: AI USE IN STRATEGY:  The Army Strategist Association, International 
Association for Strategy Professionals (Australia Chapter), Baldrige Foundation, 
and LBL Strategies are researching current and future uses of Generative AI in 
strategic management, including potential impacts, benefits, and barriers. Please 
support their research by taking the quick, anonymous survey and sharing with 
other strategy professionals in your organizations! Results will be shared with all 
survey respondents and presented at a future webinar.  (POC: Doug Maris) 

PODCAST - IMAGINE A WORLD: Can you imagine a world in 2045 where we 
manage to avoid the climate crisis, major wars, and the potential harms of artificial 
intelligence? The Future of Life Institute has launched a new podcast exploring ways 
we could build a more positive future.  

Admin & Announcements 
FFCOI Webinar: Nuclear Security Workplace and Workforce of the Future 
A team from across the Department of Energy (DOE)/National Nuclear Security 
Administration (NNSA) Labs, Plants, and Sites used strategic foresight methods 
(including trends- and scenario-based exercises) to anticipate changing global 
security and workforce dynamics and how they could impact the nuclear security 
enterprise. Join us on November 16th from 11am -12pm (ET), as we explore 
how the study describes an employee value proposition framework and tangible 
actions that can be taken at multiple levels to make the nuclear security enterprise 
an exciting, challenging, and desirable place to work now and in the future. 
Speakers include the project Co-Chairs, Elizabeth Kistin Keller (Sandia National 
Laboratories) and Lynette Landis (Kansas City National Security Campus), with 
an introduction from Monte Malin (NNSA Director for Policy). Be sure to RSVP by 
11/8 sending an email to Sharaelle A. Grzesiak to be added to the calendar 
invitation.   

CONNECT: Stay connected to learn more about FFCOI! Our website (FFCoI.org) is 
currently under construction, so follow us on LinkedIn and Twitter to get the latest 
news and happenings. Send us an email or a message on LinkedIn with ideas for 
future speakers and content. (POCs: Sharaelle A. Grzesiak, Robin Champ, & Eric 
Popiel). 
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